
Please join us for a ride on county roads to 
tour some small towns and breakfast in 
Riverside.  Plan on thirty minutes for driving.

Start at Fort Ouiatenon in West Lafayette.

Note:  From US 231 and Indiana 25 head north 
to South River Road (next light) then, turn left 
(west).  Drive for two and a half miles, the 
park entrance will be on the left, past the 
intersection with County Road 300 West.

Wabash River, Fort Ouiatenon

From the fort turn left onto South River Road.  
Continue to Green Hill.  Turn left onto County 
Road 1125 East and head south.

Downtown, Green Hill

Turn right onto County Road 500 North, it 
bends around and becomes 1100 East.

Weiler-Leopold Niches Land Trust, Independence

Road bends around again becoming 
Independence Road.

At Independence turn left onto Cicott Road / 
County Road 800 East (Warren county) / 500 
East (Fountain county).

United Baptist Church, Independence

Cross over the Wabash River.

Go through Riverside and continue south on 
County Road 500 East.

Old Barn, Riverside

About one mile south of Riverside turn right 
into Bossaer Farms.  We will have breakfast at 
the Bakery & Cafe.

Bossaer Farms Bakery & Cafe is open 
Wednesday through Saturday, 7:30 AM to 2 
PM.

Bossaer Farms Bakery & Cafe, Riverside

When leaving you can continue south on 
County Road 500 East to Indiana State Route 
28, just a couple miles south.

Or you can go back the way we came but turn 
right at the stop sign just past the railroad 
tracks.  This is a very nice road that will take 
you to Indiana State Route 25 in West Point.



For a side trip, go back to Independence and 
turn left at the four way stop and drive west 
through town.

College Rock, Independence

Turn right on County Road 600 East, about one 
mile south on the right side of the road is 
College Rock.  After talking with some of the 
professors at Purdue I believe it is miss-named 
and should be called Collage Rock as it 
probably came from the Canadian Collage 
which includes the Canadian Shield, a source 
of many rocks brought down by the ice age 
glaciers.

Please contact Tim Lange if you have questions 
765-491-0945 (text or voice) or 
tim.lange.3@gmail.com.
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